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Sundays at the Fields is a moving and unforgettable story about the power
of baseball to heal old wounds and bring people together. Set in the small
town of Cooperstown, New York, the novel follows the lives of three families
who are all connected to the town's beloved baseball team, the
Cooperstown Cubs.

The first family is the Watsons, who have been part of the Cooperstown
community for generations. John Watson is a retired baseball player who
now works as a coach for the Cubs. His wife, Mary, is a schoolteacher.
Their daughter, Sarah, is a talented softball player who dreams of playing in
the Olympics. And their son, Michael, is a shy and introverted boy who
finds solace in baseball.
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The second family is the Parkers, who are new to Cooperstown. Jim Parker
is a successful businessman who recently moved his family to town. His
wife, Susan, is a stay-at-home mom. Their daughter, Emily, is a bright and
outgoing girl who quickly makes friends at her new school. And their son,
David, is a gifted baseball player who is destined for greatness.

The third family is the Smiths, who are struggling to make ends meet. Bill
Smith is a factory worker who has been laid off from his job. His wife,
Linda, works as a waitress. Their daughter, Jessica, is a troubled teenager
who has been acting out in school. And their son, Billy, is a gifted baseball
player who is determined to follow in his father's footsteps.

As the season progresses, the lives of these three families become
intertwined in unexpected ways. John Watson takes David Parker under his
wing, teaching him the fundamentals of baseball. Jim Parker becomes a
mentor to Billy Smith, helping him to overcome his self-doubt. And Sarah
Watson and Emily Parker form a close friendship, bonding over their
shared love of softball.

But just as the Cubs are on the verge of winning the championship, tragedy
strikes. John Watson is killed in a car accident. The town is devastated, and
the Cubs' dreams of victory seem to be dashed.

In the wake of John's death, the three families must come together to find a
way to heal their wounds and move forward. They find solace in baseball,
which has always been a source of unity and strength for the community.
And they learn that even in the darkest of times, there is always hope.

Sundays at the Fields is a beautiful and heartwarming story about the
power of baseball to heal old wounds and bring people together. It is a



story that will stay with you long after you finish reading it.

Free Download your copy of Sundays at the Fields today!
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