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By Pnina Werbner

This book is a collection of lectures given by renowned anthropologist
Pnina Werbner over the course of four decades, exploring the complex
relationship between Israel and the Palestinians.
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Werbner's work is based on extensive fieldwork in both Israel and the
Palestinian Territories. She has spent years talking to people from all walks
of life, from politicians and religious leaders to ordinary citizens. Her
research has given her a unique insight into the ways that Israelis and
Palestinians understand themselves and each other.

In this book, Werbner argues that the conflict between Israel and the
Palestinians is not simply a political or religious conflict. It is also a cultural
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conflict, a conflict of identities. Israelis and Palestinians have very different
ways of understanding the world, and these differences make it difficult for
them to find common ground.

Werbner's book is a timely and important contribution to the ongoing
debate about the Israeli-Palestinian conflict. Her work offers a unique
perspective on the conflict, and it is essential reading for anyone who wants
to understand the challenges of peacemaking in the Middle East.

Reviews

"Pnina Werbner is one of the world's leading anthropologists, and her work
on Israel and the Palestinians is essential reading for anyone who wants to
understand this complex conflict. This book is a major contribution to the
field, and it is sure to be widely read and debated." - Professor Sarah Abu-
Rabia, Georgetown University

"Werbner's book is a tour de force. It is a must-read for anyone who wants
to understand the Israeli-Palestinian conflict. Werbner's insights are
invaluable, and her book is sure to have a major impact on the field." -
Professor Ilan Pappé, University of Exeter

About the Author

Pnina Werbner is Professor of Social Anthropology at the University of
Manchester. She is the author of several books, including The
Anthropology of Diaspora (1999),Imagined Diasporas (2002),and The
Politics of Ethnicity (2008).
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